






  

CLA 628: Seminar in Late Antique and Post-Imperial Latin Literature 
 

SAMPLE SYLLABUS 
 

Ammianus Marcellinus 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Ammianus Marcellinus (c. 330-395 C.E.) is often called "the last great Roman historian."  He is 
almost certainly the last great Roman historian to write in Latin and saw himself continuing in 
the tradition of Tacitus. This is all the more notable since Ammianus was, in fact, a Greek born 
in Antioch. He is one of the most important historians of the later Roman empire and the most 
important for events immediately after Constantine.  He accompanied the emperor Julian on the 
campaign against Persia in 363 which cost the young emperor his life.  After 378 he settled in 
Rome and began his history in 31 books, picking up where Tacitus left off, covering the period 
from 96 to 378 C.E.  Books 1-13 have been lost and the extant narrative begins in the year 353, 
in the last half of the reign of Constantius II (Constantine's son).  We will be reading the section 
of the work dealing with the reign of Julian, which forms a discreet unit and is the best source for 
the life of the fascinating last pagan emperor of Rome.  In addition to reading, translating, and 
commenting upon the grammatical, literary, and historical aspects of the text,  students will be 
asked to complete various research  assignments on the voluminous recent work published on 
Ammianus.  
 
TEXTS 

 
For this course, I have ordered the Teubner edited by W. Seyfarth, reprinted with revisions in 
1999 (ISBN 3519019760). Since many of you will be unfamiliar with the later Roman Empire, I 
have also ordered the Penguin translation by Walter Hamilton, Ammianus Marcellinus, The 
Later Roman Empire, A.D. 354-378 (ISBN 0140444068) and G.W. Bowersock's handy little 
Julian the Apostate, published in 1978.   
 
There is a multi-volume commentary by P. De Jonge which I will check out of the library and 
place in room 1043; I will check out other recent works on Ammianus and put them on the shelf 
there as well.  For general background on the times and character of the later empire, any 
historical survey covering the period should prove helpful.  The first 150 pages of A.H.M. Jones, 
The Later Roman Empire, vol. I. will in particular give a solid survey; I'll place a copy in 1043. 
 
ASSIGNMENTS 
 
Reading and translating the text will form the bulk of work in this course.  Students will be 
expected to prepare the assigned text for each class and will be called upon at random to translate 
anywhere in the assignment.  Though the entire assignment must be prepared, not all of it will 
necessarily be gone over in class.  Students are nevertheless responsible for the entire assignment 
on exams, etc.  If it appears useful as the course progresses, a distinction may be made in the 
reading load between undergraduate and graduate students.  See Reading Schedule below.  
Students should also be aware that certain in-class sight-reading exercises are also likely. 
 
 
 



 
 
Research assignments.  Since I presume that the later empire will be new to most if not all of 
you, my interest is in having every student learn something about this period, according to their 
interests.  And there is a wealth of interest to be had: religious change, paganism, and the rise of 
Christianity; the reconstruction of the empire politically and economically; the rise of autocratic 
monarchy; the "decline and fall" of Rome itself.  I would prefer that as questions arise or you run 
into topics on which you would like to learn more, you will volunteer for short research 
assignments to uncover and present information to the rest of the class.  If this proves 
impractical, a list of topics will be distributed for students to sign up.  As the course progresses, 
we will determine exactly how this will be done.  An oral presentation in class accompanied by 
written work submitted to the instructor will be the basic form of the assignment.      
 
A major research paper will be written for this course, due at the end of the semester.  Specific 
details and requirements for this paper will be specified in detail on a separate sheet, distributed a 
bit later as the course progresses. 
 
Lastly, there will be a midterm and final translation exam.   
 
GRADING & ATTENDANCE  
 
Though as mentioned above we will need to work out the specifics on the research projects as 
the course progresses, the various assignments for this course will constitute your final grade 
according to the following percentages: 
 
reading & translation 20% 
research assignments 25% 
midterm exam 15% 
final exam 15% 
research paper 25%   
 
All grades will be assigned as letters: A, B, C, E (there is no D in the graduate school grade 
scale).  For purposes of calculation, these will correspond to the usual scale of: 
 A = 4 points   B = 3   C = 2   E = 0. 
For the final course grade, points will averageaccording to the percentages above and final 
grades will given on the following scale: 
 a final average of 3.7 to 4.0   = A 
                                         3.0 to 3.69 = B 
                                         2.0 to 2.99 = C 
                                         below 2.0  = E.                    
 
In a class of this nature and level, attendance at every class session is expected.  Unexcused 
absences in excess of three (3) will result in the lowering of your final mark for the course by 
one full grade.  Please note that absences may be excused either for the reasons laid out in 
Student Rights and Responsibilities, or by securing my permission beforehand, or by consulting 
with me personally afterward in an unavoidable circumstance.  I do reserve the right to reject an 
excuse other than those mandated in Student Rights and Responsibilities. 
 
 
 



  

PROJECTED SCHEDULE  (subject to revision as course progresses) 
 
date   Amm. Teubner pp.  

Jan  16 -  15.8 56-60    

 18 - 16.1-3 69-72 

 23 - 16.4-5 72-76  

 25 - 20.1-3 183-188 

 30 - 20.4-5 188-194 

Feb 1 - 20.6-7 194-200 

 6 - 20.8-9 200-205 

 8 - 20.10-11 205-214 

 13 - 21.1-4 215-221 

 15 - 21.5-6 221-226 

 20 - 21.7-10 226-232 

 22 - 21.11-12 232-238 

 27 - 21.13-14 238-243 

Mar 1 -  21.15 243-249 

  

 6 -  MIDTERM EXAM 

 8 - 22.1-3 250-254 

                      Spring Break 

Mar 20- 22.4-7 254-260 

 22 - 22.9-11 270-277  

 27 - 22.12-14 277-282 

 29 -  23.1-3 294-299 

Apl 3 - 23.5 302-307 

 5 - 24.1-2 325-333 

 10 - 24.3-24.4.20     333-339 

 17 - 24.4.21-24.6.7  339-345 

 19 - 24.6.8-24.8.7    345-350 

 24 - 25.1-25.3.15     351-358 

 26- 25.3.16-25.4     358-365 

May  3 -     3:30 PM—FINAL EXAM 
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